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Dear Loyal Clients and Partners – Our goal for over 26 years now is to 
make it as easy as possible for Western and European businesses to 
join-and succeed-in the thriving Asia markets. We have an educated 
and professional team, most of whom are also bilingual and work 
tirelessly to provide premium client care. "The Dubai office is available to 
international clients giving them the ability to get support in this rapidly 
expanding region. Our Dubai team has solid relationships with local and 
regional companies. We understand the rich cultural diversity of the 
region, its languages, and its customs. This part of the world is eager 
and ready to support foreign investment and new business 
opportunities. We will help with the complexities of international 
expansion. Thank you for your continued support." Warm Regards – 
Neil Satterwhite, Founder and CEO  
 

Insurance Services: Tiger-Consulting continues to offer a full suite of 
group and individual, local and international insurance benefits coverage 
including medical, travel, life and dental. Our health insurance benefits 
we offer are highly comprehensive, and come at competitive or 
discounted rates for clients and non- clients, individuals, families, and 
groups across Asia. We find local health insurance solutions with the 
highest service standards, compliant with local laws and regulations.  
 
Our clients can choose from quality plans through local and international 
providers along with the convenience of our offices in 14 Asian 
countries, as well as the UAE and USA. We work with different health 
Insurance carriers and agents in order to tailor solutions to our clients 
depending on their country and specific needs. Anyone is eligible to 
receive benefit services as long as it is in compliance with the local laws 
of the host country.  
 
An assessment will determine final eligibility. Pricing and family member 
eligibility will vary depending on age and medical history. Furthermore, 
dental coverage can be included as an add-on to a medical plan in most 

  



cases. We even offer life insurance plans with eligibility being very 
similar to the requirements of the health insurance solutions.  
 

Holiday Calendars: Keep up to speed on the legal holidays in the 
countries we serve. Learn more  
 

Check Out our latest news "Tiger-Consulting's Global Payroll Tips 
because Global Expansion is a Major Milestone that can be Complex & 
full of Legal and Cultural Commitments" Learn more  
 
Learn more about our services  
 
Contact us today with any questions you may have about our support 
services across Asia. Custom quotes are complimentary. Just email 
info@tiger-consulting.net  
 

Let’s Keep in Touch:  

Australia | Cambodia | China | Hong Kong | India | Indonesia | Korea | Malaysia  
| New Zealand | Philippines | Singapore | Taiwan | Thailand | Vietnam | UAE | U.S.  
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